Consignors:

Sale Price

No

1 F Smilage Driven To Win Smile By The Mile Meridian Farms Derek Stout S 2,200.00
2 s Cigar-Party ClintonsCigar Beyond-Paradise Al-Neuraguter Withdrawn S -

3 C My Boss Clintons Cigar Kramers Rule Jim Rhodes Blair Corbeil S 2,200.00
4 F Book My Flite Jeremes Jet Book Smart Larry Hanson George Rogers $10,000.00
5 F Broadway Pebbles Admirals Galley Broadway Babe Fred Gilbert RNA S -

6 C Chicago Joe DM Dilinger CAl Hanover Meridian Farms Bob Watt S 3,500.00

7 F Jengo Camystic Jenns Star Jim Rhodes No Bid S -

8 F Withacherryontop Camystic Come Take My Pan Jim Rhodes Rod Hennessy S 1,000.00
9 c Mr-Money Camystic Disagreement Keith-Clark Withdrawn S -
10 F Double L Starlight Perfect Union Double L Annabella Double L Standardbreds Dick Schneider S 1,200.00
11 F Double L Digger Perfect Union Double L Hot Trap Double L Standardbreds No Bid S -
12 F Two Timing Brandons Cowboy |Duplex Outlaw Stable Buy Back S -
13 G Blue Eyed Cowboy Brandons Cowboy |Eicarls Blue Eyes Kurt & Kathy Schmidt Rod Starkewski S 1,700.00
14 F Mystic Return Camystic Expensive Return Keith-Clark Withdrawn S -
15 c Get-There Overnite ClintonsCigar Express-Overnite Al-Neurauter Withdrawn S -
16 C B C Lightning Brandons Cowboy |Fantasy Girl Jim Rhodes Jamie Gray S 1,000.00
17 C First With Promise As Promised First On Board Skywest Farms No Bid

18 F Flaming N Princess As Promised Flaming Princess Skywest Farms Al Jensen S 1,000.00
19 C Willey Bite If I Can Dream Forbidden Affair Fred Gilbert Lorne Duffeild S 9,500.00
20 F Venice Beach Allamerican Native |Venus Blue Chip Meridian Farms Buy Back S -
21 F Betty Kroker I Am A Fool Four Starzz Peach Fred Gilbert RNA S -
22 F Promised Freedom As Promised Freedom Street Skywest Farms No Bid S -
23 F Kinda Funky Camystic Funky Kim Meridian Farms Harold Haining S 1,000.00
24 G Cenalta Awesome Allamerican Merlin |Gravel Gertie Gordon & Helen Empey No BId S -
25 C Speed Shift Driven To Win Stonebridge Talent Meridian Farms Wally McKay S 3,500.00
26 F Happy Promise As Promised Happy Scoot Skywest Farms Rod Hennessy S 2,000.00
27 F Three Wishes DM Dilinger I Wish | Knew Meridian Farms Moroz/Wychopen S 1,000.00
28 F Barona Mercedes Brandons Cowboy |Insurance Fee Barona Yearlings Kelly Hoerdt S 5,700.00
29 F Barona Montana Camystic lola M Barona Yearlings RNA




30 C Comes Home First Brandons Cowboy |Cinderella Cam Jim Rhodes JJJ Stables $ 20,000.00
31 F Drawing A Dream Artistic Fella JK Fantasy Cressman Farms Don Monkman S 3,400.00
32 F Jadens Wish Camystic What You Wish For Jim Rhodes Keith Clark S 3,500.00
33 C Regina Beach Brandons Cowboy |Beach Lightning Meridian Farms Loftus/Campbell/Robinson | S 6,000.00
34 C Keyword Camystic Keystone Divine Outlaw Stable Buy Back S -

35 F Me Adorable Rescue Me KG Adora S D Johnson Buy Back S -

36 C Cowboy Mathis Brandons Cowboy |Bonny Mathis Jim Rhodes Keith Clark S 9,500.00
37 F Minettas Moonbeam |Lusty Leader Lucky X Ample Minettas Holdings Kirk Thomas S 1,000.00
38 F Make Three Wishes Brandons Cowboy |Make Some Noise Cliff & Kathy Coonfer Keith Clark S 6,000.00
39 G Eddies First Cousin DM Dilinger Matt In The Hat Fred Gilbert Graeme Bevington S 5,000.00
40 C Gentlemans Honor D M Dilinger Michelles Heart Meridian Farms Rod Hennessy S 5,500.00
41 F Minettas Munchkin Lusty Leader Minettas Martini Minettas Holdings No Bid S -

42 F Blue Monday Camystic Miss Lady Blues Outlaw Stable Buy Back S -

43 C Ghost Pine Badlands Hanover |Just Sassy Meridian Farms Blair Corbeil $ 15,000.00
44 G Pass The Port Freedoms Pass Newport Beauty S D Johnson Buy Back S -

45 F Night Affair Camystic Nightofpandemonium |Meridian Farms Rod Hennessy S 4,000.00
46 F Tap Away Brandons Cowboy |Tapioca Hanover Meridian Farms JJJ Stables S 16,000.00
47 C Oh Yeah Camystic Odds On Tally Meridian Farms Kennedy/Rumpel $10,500.00
48 C Lone Rider Brandons Cowboy |Presidents Lady Meridian Farms George Rogers S 7,500.00
49 F Double L Fab Camystic One Hot Lady Double L Standardbreds Glenn Lutz S 1,200.00
50 Cc One Time Intention No Pan Intended |Onetimeatpancamp Cressman Farms Shannon Crump S 2,700.00
51 F Nanaimo Camystic Pacific Rhapsody Meridian Farms Riverside Stables S 2,000.00
52 F Paper Trail Driven To Win Paper Bright Meridian Farms Greaeme Bevington S 6,000.00
53 F Mothers Melody Camystic Pop Art Outlaw Stable Gray/Ransom S 6,500.00
54 G Presidential Pass Freedoms Pass Presidential Jenna S D Johnson Rod Hennessy S 8,500.00
55 F War Feather Camystic Western Gift Meridian Farms Gray/Bertrand S 3,200.00
56 F Barona Malibu Camystic Prom Miss Barona Yearlings RNA S -

57 F Chantbrielle Camystic RB Ethel Mertz Willie & Diane Neish Judy Adams S 1,600.00
58 C Rebel Fire Camystic Raging Red Head Meridian Farms Rod Starkewski S 2,200.00
59 G Sotally Tober As-Promised Rain-Drep-Hanever Kurt & Kathy-Schmidt Withdrawn S -




60 G The Big Heist No Pan Intended |Red Star Sugar Gal Cliff & Kathy Coonfer Buy Back S -
61 G Cenalta Challenger Allamerican Merlin |Ride The Shark Gordon & Helen Empey Dick Schneider S 1,000.00
62 C Cinnamon Cracker Camcracker Saras Season Skywest Farms No Bid S -
63 F Blue Star Escape Brandons Cowboy |Shes Camazing William Zaretsky Blair Corbeil S 1,000.00
64 F Jazzy Jet Jeremes Jet Small Town Beauty Cressman Farms Don Richardson S 2,000.00
65 C Rodeo Joe Brandons Cowboy |Four Starz Bella Meridian Farms Moroz/Wychopen S 24,000.00
66 F Double L Bertha Camystic Smoken Sassy Double L Standardbreds Riverside Stables S 1,000.00
67 G Barona Mazeratti Camystic Solheim Barona Yearlings Rod Hennessy S 9,500.00
68 F Justapassin Fanci Stonebridge Regal |Southwind Jubie Kurt & Kathy Schmidt Buy Back S -
69 C B C Gold Brandons Cowboy |Sparkies Gold Jim Rhodes Gary Clark S 2,700.00
70 F Cenaltafirecracker Allamerican Merlin |Spirit Of Fire Gordon & Helen Empey Stephen Crump S 2,500.00
71 F Modern Dance Driven To Win Modigliani Meridian Farms Blair Corbeil S 5,000.00
72 C Lucha Vavoom No Pan Intended |Sugar Park Greg Martin Buy Back S -
73 F Her-Royal-Hotness Blue-Burner Takemetotheriver e el o Withdrawn S -
74 c Fontos Grin FortApache TantasGrin Dan-Sifert Withdrawn S -
75 F Firstforthegilrs Brandons Cowboy |On The Fly Meridian Farms David Lamont S 1,700.00
76 F Cassie Cracker Camcracker Tarport Legacy Skywest Farms James Zurawel S 1,000.00
77 C Western Fortune Camystic The Real West Al Neurauter Riverside Stables S 1,500.00
78 F Triple Action Brandons Cowboy |The Three Of Us Outlaw Stable Raggs To Riches S 3,500.00
79 F Ultimate Cracker As Promised Ultimate Adventure Skywest Farms John Chappell S 1,400.00
80 F Great Desire Real Desire Gray Lady Gray Meridian Farms Graeme Bevington S 8,000.00
81 C Pink Jaguar Driven To Win Odds On Julie Meridian Farms Rene Goulet S 1,800.00
82 F Reserved Lady Freedoms Pass Western Reserve S D Johnson Buy Back S -
83 C Fast Promise As Promised Joanalina Jim Rhodes Gilbert/Manning S 2,700.00
84 F Everymove A Picture |Brandons Cowboy |Aeolian Hanover Kurt & Kathy Schmidt Glenn Lutz S 1,300.00
85 F Happy Tune As Promised All Tuned Up Skywest Farms No Bid S -
86 F Sacred Valley Fort Apache Artful Dan Sifert Buy Back S -
87 C Painting The Wind Clintons Cigar Arts And Letters Jim Rhodes Gray/Ransom/Bertrand S 6,100.00
96 Yearling Clintons Legacy Clintons Cigar Western Rustler Al Neurauter No Bid S -
167 | Racehorse |Me Myself and | Rescue Me Astro Dream Sam Johnson Buy Back S -
L8| Heschesse  |Repolholiiad BromdeonsCoviboy  |EropaolDecoze e Withdrawn 3 -
169 | Racehorse |Silent Rescue Rescue Me Bay Bea Sign Sam Johnson Buy Back 3 -
204 | Broodmare |Armbro Carousel Armbro Operative |Armbro Bala Meadowlark Farms No Bid S -
205 | Broodmare |Beat The Bomb Bomb Rickles Armbro Impish Sam Johnson No Bid S -
206 | Broodmare |Book Smart Village Jiffy Next Chapter Larry Hanson Bill Andrew S 5,000.00




207 | Brooedmare |Freshette FreedomsPass Aesrtern Reserve SamJohnson Withdrawn S -
208 | Broodmare |Jk Fantasy Life Sign Miss Saigon Cressman Farms Cory Manning S 700.00
209 | Broodmare |MattsIn Town Matts Scooter Town Dreamer Meadowlark Farms No Bid S -
218 | Breedmere |MeedewlowlsDeolote |Coraystic Nice Yankee Meadowlark-Farms Withdrawn S -
211 | Broodmare |Onetimeatpancamp |The Panderosa The Pana Sutra Cressman Farms Outback Stable S 800.00
212 | Broodmare |Presidential Jenna Jennas Beach Boy |Presidentialaffair Sam Johnson Buy Back S -
212 | Eroedmere |TentosGen Grinfromegrtocsr | TanteHemever e Withdrawn S -
214 | Broodmare |Twin B Magical Dexter Nukes Daylon Magic Larry Hanson RNA S -
215 | Broodmare |Western Reserve Western Hanover |So Fresh Sam Johnson Buy Back S -
216 | Racehorse |You Must Be Joking Camcracker Shes A Joke Don Richardson Blair Thomas S 2,000.00
217 | Racehorse |The Express As Promised Annika Don Richardson Lynn Paterson S 300.00
218 | Racehorse |Fulla Promise As Promised Lucky At Love Don Richardson In The Crease Stables S 1,600.00
219 | Racehorse |Hot Attack As Promised Cr Hot Salsa Don Richardson Brent Lee S 800.00




