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Senior Judges Report 
 

Name of Track      Rideau Carleton Ottawa 

Date     Thursday 17 June 2021 Post Time 1600 hours 

Weather   Races 1 - 10: Clear (Temp: 24 deg. C)  Wind: 18 km/h (West) 

Track Condition Races 1 - 10: Fast (Variant 0 secs)   

Number of Races 10 Qualifying races  Ø Total Entries  76/85 

Mutual Handle $143,504 

Contact  
Vet     

  Paddock 
Meeting 

 Yes Track  
Maintenance Meeting 

  Investigator  
Visit 

  Outgoing Senior  
Judge Update 

  

 

Senior Judge Associate Judge Associate Judge 

Weber, Michael Coles, Sharla  Stiff, Al (remote) 

Report on day’s events:  
(Accidents, claims, fines and/or suspensions, objections and/or disqualifications, refunds and any other pertinent incidents)  …. 

Office:  

• Paddock meeting held to explain rule modifications as of 16 April.  

• Early Judges scratch (ineligible; must qualify) of SAVINI from the first race.  

Races:  

• Samuel Fillion excused from one drive.  

1. Start delayed due to broken equipment on #3 MONTANABLACKANGEL. Inquiry on the 
performance of #3 MONTANABLACKANGEL (Pascal Berube) who broke stretch and 
finish, #3 finished 3rd placed 5th for a double lapped-on break at the wire and failure to 
continuously lose ground while off stride (AGCO rule 22.27). Clear.  

Video: https://youtu.be/qwodCJAT5sg  

2. Inquiry on the performance of #1 BARRYS SHELBY (Ryan Guy) concerning possibly 
leaving the course before the ¼ mile pole; #1 was inside one pylon and contacted the 
subsequent pylon, no advantage gained and no violations.  

Video: https://youtu.be/iqk7casvyMU  

The AGCO veterinarian examined #2 CASSIUS post-race and reported no 
physiological problems. Clear.  

3. Clear.  
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4. Recall due to broken equipment (flat tire) on #3 HOLY BEING (Guy Gagnon). #4 
BLOGMASTER (Stephane Brosseau) suffered broken equipment (head pole) before 
the ¼ mile pole and subsequently broke (charted with an equipment break) and finished 
with broken equipment. Clear.  

5. Reviewed breaks by #2 THE GIRLS OF IMAGE (Robert Robinson) and #3 
THINKINGOFYOUBABE (Guy Gagnon) after the start and before the ¼ mile pole; no 
interference and no violations of the breaking rules; #2 suffered broken equipment 
(stirrup) after the start and finished with broken equipment. Clear.  

6. Clear.  

7. Late Judges scratch (injured) of #4 WISH KEY K, refund: $539.  

Inquiry on the performance of #7 DIAMOND ROCK (Pascal Berube) who broke before 
the ¼ mile pole and finished 4th; no violation of the breaking rules by #7.  

Video: https://youtu.be/K5AIxGFUspc  

WATCH ME ERUPT #8 suffered broken equipment (crupper) after the start and 
finished with broken equipment. Clarified what is considered acceptable urging with the 
drivers of #2 SOUTHWIND BRONN, Clarke Steacy, and #5 AMERICAN WAY, Marie 
Claude Auger. Clear.  

8. Reviewed the break by #7 APHRO STAR (Daniel Laflamme) after the ¾ mile pole; 
while off stride #7 did cause interference to #4 LEVIS DAY and #6 WHATS IN THE 
ESKY; no placing necessary as #7 finished posterior to the horses suffering 
interference. Clear.  

9. Clear.  

10. Reviewed the performance of #3 SIR A (Jacques Beaudoin) who broke before the ¼ 
mile pole and qualifies for breaks (trainer notified); while off stride #3 did cause 
interference to #5 GOT SEXY SCARS (Rodney Laframboise), no placing necessary as 
#3 finished behind #5. Clear.  

Claims: None 

 

https://youtu.be/K5AIxGFUspc

